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CPSU NSW Member Survey: Have Your Say on Enterprise 
Bargaining at NSWALC 
As you are probably aware, the current NSWALC 
enterprise agreement reaches its nominal expiry 
shortly, and we want to hear from you. Click 
HERE for a copy of the current enterprise 
agreement.  

We have put together a short survey to gauge 
your priorities and interests as we begin the 
process of bargaining with NSWALC for a new 
agreement.   

Click HERE and enter you membership number to 
complete the survey   

The Community and Public Sector Union (CPSU 
NSW) approached NSWALC late last year to 
discuss negotiation arrangements and protocols. 
To accommodate staff, leave over Christmas and 
New Year, we agreed to delay bargaining until 
February 2020. 

Understandably however the NSWALC has spent 
much of the intervening period focussed on 
assisting communities effected by an 
unprecedented bushfire season across NSW, and 
we have supported the Council in this important 
work.   

In saying that, we are mindful of the need to make 
a new agreement for NSWALC staff and we have 
again written to the Council to confirm timeframes. 
We now expect to commence a formal bargaining 
process in early April 2020. Click HERE for a copy 
of the Council’s response to our enquiries  

CPSU NSW Members Meeting – Enterprise 
Bargaining  

You are warmly invited to attend a meeting with 
our Senior Industrial Officer, Thane Pearce and 
Organiser, Kirra Jackson: 

Topic: Enterprise Bargaining 

When: 1:00pm - Tuesday, 3 March 2020  

Where: Lvl 5 Meeting Room, 33 Argyle Street, 
Parramatta. 

We are conscious that not all members will be 
able to attend this meeting. If you would like 
further information about enterprise 
bargaining, or any other work issue, do not 
hesitate to call Kirra or Thane on 1300 772 679. 

Not a member? Join today HERE 

United We Bargain, Divided We Beg!       

 

https://twitter.com/psansw?lang=en
http://www.cpsunsw.org.au
https://www.facebook.com/cpsunsw
https://www.fwc.gov.au/documents/documents/agreements/fwa/ae424467.pdf
https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/TG5Q2XN
https://cpsunsw.org.au/wp-content/uploads/2020/03/NSWALC-Enterprise-Bargaining-2020.pdf
https://cpsunsw.org.au/join

